Bid Tabulation

ITB 17-18

HOUSING REHABILIATION SERVICES
Regina Johnson, Principal Buyer

johnsonre@jccal.org

Bid Group Name

Bid Detail Description

UOM

ACOFF

MCDONALD

S&W

UNCH

Grand Total

$ 336,928.00

$  93,800.00

$ 63,125.00

$ 162,020.00

PROJECT 1

Mr. Jimmy Walker
505 Seminole Circle
Fairfield, AL 35064
P: 401-7855

Case #: 17-20-1

EA

$ 24,100.00

$  20,700.00

NO BID

$ 19,950.00

PROJECT 2

OPTION 1: Mrs. Rosemarie Sullivan
580 Bessie Lane

Trussville, AL 35173

P: 683-9670; 821-6549

Case #: 17-17-4

EA

$ 18,500.00

NO BID

$ 9,750.00

$ 11,650.00

OPTION 2: Mrs. Rosemarie Sullivan
580 Bessie Lane

Trussville, AL 35173

P: 683-9670; 821-6549

Case #: 17-17-4

EA

©

23,700.00

NO BID

$ 17,525.00

$ 7,975.00

PROJECT 3

Jacqueline Jelks

543 Argonne Drive
CenterPoint, AL 35215
P: 205-396-4495

Case #: 17-16-4

EA

$ 22,980.00

$  16,300.00

$ 19,900.00

$ 24,210.00

PROJECT 4

Dominic Cobb
1457 4th Place NW
Birmingham, AL
P: 240-2451

Case #: 17-8-1

EA

$ 24,040.00

$  22,700.00

$ 15,950.00

$ 16,270.00

PROJECT 5

OPTION 1: Catherine Minter
805 11th Ave.

Midfield, AL 35228

(205) 907-2541

Case #: 17-14-1

EA

$ 27,320.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 19,070.00

OPTION 2: Catherine Minter
805 11th Ave.

Midfield, AL 35228

(205) 907-2541

Case #: 17-14-1

EA

©

7,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

$ 7,860.00

PROJECT 6

OPTION 1: Eddie Lee
3830 Howard Ave.
Brighton, AL 35020
(323) 407-2773

Case #: 16-6-2

EA

$ 24,700.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

OPTION 2: Eddie Lee
3830 Howard Ave.
Brighton, AL 35020
(323) 407-2773

Case #: 16-6-2

EA

©

5,000.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

PROJECT 7

Thomas Rowe

282 8th Street NE
Gryasville, AL 35073
P: 586-1001

Case #: 16-4-3

EA

$ 17,500.00

$  15,300.00

NO BID

$ 17,500.00




Anthony Williams $ 17,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3926 McClellan Ave.
PROJECT 8 Brighton, AL 35020 EA
P: 744-2090
Case #: 17-4-2
Lavern Grayson $ 25,000.00| $ 18,800.00| NOBID $ 18,860.00
400 62nd Street
PROJECT 9 Fairfield, AL 35064 EA
P: 786-7022
Case #: 17-10-1
Ruby Jones $ 22,160.00 NO BID NO BID $ 18,675.00
403 58th Street
PROJECT 10 Fairfield, AL 35064 EA
P: 780-2668
Case #: 18-3-1
Martha Caudle $ 77,228.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
216 Oak Circle
PROJECT 11 Bessemer, AL 35023 EA
P: 434-2336
Case #: DR-17-7-3
Required Forms
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES YES YES
Equal Opportunity Certification Form YES YES YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES YES YES
Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13-9 YES YES YES YES
Signature Sheet YES YES YES YES
Contractors Certification Regarding Debarment, Suspension, and Other... YES YES NO YES
Price Sheet YES YES YES YES
Addendum Number 1 YES NO NO YES

Contact Information

ACOFF 1924 17th St. N., Bessemer, AL 35020 | Roosevelt Acoff, Sr. P: 205-424-6358 E: acoffconstruction@gmail.com
MCDONALD 2400 Ave. J., Birmingham, AL 35218 | Darvin McDonald P: -205-370-3468 E:

S&W 150 Tyler Rd., Remlap, AL 35133 | Roger Shirley P: 205-965-5086 E:

UNCH 524 4th Avenue North, Birmingham, AL 35204 | Michael J. Raby P: 205-581-1688 E: unch524@gmail.com




